ITFL/SEC/2025-26/DEC/01
BSE Limited

Phiroze Jeejeebhoy Towers,
Dalal Street,

Mumbai — 400 001

Scrip Code — 533329

Dear Sir/Madam,

4t December 2025

National Stock Exchange of India Limited
Exchange Plaza, 5" Floor, Plot No. C/1,

G Block, Bandra-Kurla Complex,

Bandra (East), Mumbai- 400 051

NSE Symbol: INDTERRAIN

Sub.: Newspaper advertisement for Special Window for re-lodgment of transfer requests
of physical shares — Reg.

Ref.: (1) SEBI/HO/MIRSD/MIRSD-PoD/P/CIR/2025/97 dated 2" July 2025

(“SEBI Circular”)

(2) Our earlier intimation vide ITFL/SEC/2025-26/AUG/01 dated 4™ August 2025
and ITFL/SEC/2025-26/0CT/02 dated 6 October 2025

As per the captioned subject and reference and pursuant to Regulation 47 of the SEBI (Listing
Obligations and Disclosure Requirements) Regulations, 2015, please find enclosed newspaper
advertisements, regarding facilitation to eligible shareholders for re-lodgement of transfer
requests of physical shares, published in Business Standard (English) and Tamil Murasu
(Tamil) on 4™ December 2025. The advertisement is also available on the website of company
viz https://www.indianterrain.com/pages/investor-information

This is for your information and records. Kindly acknowledge the receipt of the same.

Thanking you,

Yours faithfully,

For Indian Terrain Fashions Limited

SAl NATH Dlgltally signed

AINATH

SUNDAR SUNDARAM
Date: 2025.12.04
AM 15:41:30 +05'30'

Sainath Sundaram

Company Secretary & Compliance Officer

INDIAN TERRAIN FASHIONS LIMITED

Registered Office: Survey No 549/2 & 232 Plot No.4, Thirukkachiyur & Sengundram
Industrial Area, Singaperumal Koil Post,
eeeemeniems [NDIAN TERRAIN
Email ID: response.itfl@indianterrain.com
Website: www.indianterrain.com

CIN: L18101TN2009PLC073017


https://www.indianterrain.com/pages/investor-information

CHENNAI | THURSDAY, 4 DECEMBER 2025 Business Standard

Reliance Asset Reconstruction Company Ltd.
Corp. Office: 11th Floor, North Side, R-Tech Park, Western Express Highway,
Goregaon (East), Mumbai- 400063.

RELIANCe

Asset Reconstruction

Notice for Sale of Secured Assets [See Rule 8(6)]

E-Auction Sale Notice for Sale of Inmovable Assets under the Securitisation and Reconstruction of Financial
Assets and Enforcement of Security Interest Act, 2002 read with proviso to Rule 8 (6) of the Security Interest
(Enforcement) Rules, 2002

Notice is hereby given to the public in general and in particular to the Borrower (s) and Guarantor (s) that the
below described immovable/movable properties mortgaged/hypothecated to the Secured Creditor, the
physical possession of which has been taken by the Authorised Officer of Secured Creditor.

That, Religare Housing Development Finance Corporation Ltd. has vide two separate Assignment Agreement
dated 29.03.2019 and 29.03.2023 assigned the financial assets/debts of below mentioned loan accounts
along with its right, title and interest together with underlying securities in favour of Reliance Asset
Reconstruction Company Ltd. (RARC) trustee of RARC 059 (RHDFCL HL) Trust and RARC 080
(RHDFCL HL) Trust. By virtue of the said assignment, we have become your secured creditor and lawfully
entitled to recover the entire contractual dues.

Therefore, the undersigned Authorised Officer of Reliance Asset Reconstruction Company Ltd., hereby give
you notice of 15 days that the below mentioned mortgaged properties shall be sold by the undersigned by way
of E-auction on “Asis where is”, “As is whatis”, and “Whatever there is” on 26.12.2025, for recovery of amount
mentioned in demand notice u/s 13(2) plus future interest and cost due to Reliance Asset Reconstruction
Company Limited as a trustee of RARC 059 (RHDFCL HL) Trust and RARC 080 (RHDFCL HL) Trust
Secured Creditor from mentioned borrowers/mortgagers. The reserve price and the earnest money deposit

(EMD)areas under: Description of mortgaged property:
"]2‘ Borrowers name, Property Details, demand notice and date Rese;:DPrm

RARC 059 (RHDFCL HL) Trust

1 | RSAMPATH AND SUDHA SAMPATH BOTH R/O SHOP NO. 7/3. PERANDAPALLI VILLAGE
& POST SRI THIRUMAL PHUMATIC COMPANY, UPSTAIRS, HOSUR TK, KRISHNAGIRI,
TAMILNADU-635002 ALSO AT:- PATTANO.1180, SURVEY NO.211/1A (NEW S.NO.211/1A1),
SALEMWESTDISTRICT, SALEM TALUK, KANNANGURICHI VILLAGE, TAMILNADU

Property: ALL THAT PIECE AND PARCEL OF SALEM WEST REGISTRATION DISTRICT,
SALEM WEST SUB REGISTRATION DISTRICT, SALEM TALUK, KANNANGURICHI
VILLAGE, PATTANO. 1180, SURVEY NO.211/1A(NEW S.NO.211/1A1), PUNJAIHECTARE

Rs.
31,74,795/-

U GRO Capital Limited

4th Floor, Tower 3, Equinox Business Park, LBS Road, Kurla,
Mumbai 400070

It is hereby informed that the Auction Notice published on 06.11.2025 in Business
Standard and Hindu-Tamil newspapers, pertaining to the Borrower 1.SREE SAl
TRADERS, 2. SATHYA 3. LOGANATHAN 4. PADMAVATHI (LAN:- UGTIRSS0000061973)
“In the publication of the scheduled auction dated 09-12-2025 due to clerical error,
the reserve price and EMD amount mentioned of the Sr. No.8 belongs to 1.SREE
SAI TRADERS, 2. SATHYA 3. LOGANATHAN 4. PADMAVATHI is 2,15,00,000/- and
21,50,000/- in the place of 1,07,00,000 and 1,07,00,00.

CORRIGENDUM TO AUCTION NOTICE

Please consider updated Reserve Price: 1,07,00,000 and
EMD amount:1,07,00,00 as bidding amount”.

Rest of the content shall remain unchanged.
Place: COIMBATORE
Date: 04.12.2025

Sd/-(Authorised Officer)

For UGRO Capital Limited

Reliance Asset Reconstruction Company Ltd.
Corp. Office: 11th Floor, North Side, R-Tech Park, Western Express Highway,
Goregaon (East), Mumbai- 400063.

RELIANCe

Asset Reconstruction

Notice for Sale of Secured Assets [See Rule 8(6)]

E-Auction Sale Notice for Sale of Inmovable Assets under the Securitisation and Reconstruction of Financial
Assets and Enforcement of Security Interest Act, 2002 read with proviso to Rule 8 (6) of the Security Interest
(Enforcement) Rules, 2002

Notice is hereby given to the public in general and in particular to the Borrower (s) and Guarantor (s) that the
below described immovable/movable properties mortgaged/hypothecated to the Secured Creditor, the
physical possession of which has been taken by the Authorised Officer of Secured Creditor.

That, Religare Housing Development Finance Corporation Ltd. has vide two separate Assignment Agreement
dated 29.03.2019 and 29.03.2023 assigned the financial assets/debts of below mentioned loan accounts
anng with ns nght title and interest together with underlying securities in favour of Reliance Asset

0.37.0, ASSESSMENT RS.2.05 (P.A.0.91 CENTS), ENTIRE AREA OF P.A.0.91 CENTS,
SURVEY NO.211/1B, PUJAI HECTARE 0.06.0, ASSESSMENT RS.0.35, IN THIS 1/3RD
SHARE, i.e. PA.0.05 CENTS, IN TOTAL AN AREA OF P.A.0.96 CENTS OF LAND, IN THIS
AN AREA OF 1472 1/2 SQ. FEET. BOUNDED BY:- NORTH: ~ SUNDARAJAN AND
BANUMATHI LAND, SOUTH: SUBRAMANI PROPERTY AND COMMON PATHWAY, EAST:
GANESAN PROPERTY,WEST: RAJAPROPERTY

Demand notice: Rs. 23,49,341.73/- (Rs. Twenty Three Lakh Fourty Nine Thousand Three
Hundred Fourty One Paise Seventy Three Only) as on 15-02-2019 plus future interest & cost.
Constructive/Physical Possession date: 06.01.2025

Rs.
3,17,479.5/-

Inspection of Property 1 23.12.2025 from11.00 A.M.t002.00 P.M.
Last date for bid submission : 24.12.2025ill 5.00 PM
Date of e-auction 1 26.12.2025 between 11 AMto 1 P.Mwith extension of 5 minutes each

TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF SALE:

1. The property shall not be sold below the reserve price and sale is subject to the confirmation by RARC as a
secured creditor. 2. E-auction will be conducted ONLINE through M/s. C1 INDIAPVT LTD at Plot No 68 Gurgaon
Haryana pin Code 122003. 3. Before participating in E- auction, the intending bidders should hold a valid e-mail id
and register their names at portal www.bankeauctions.com and get their User ID and password from M/s. C1 INDIA
PVT LTD.). 4. Prospective bidders may avail online training on E-Auction from M/s. C1 INDIA PVT LTD.,
(Contact Person : Mr. Dharani Krishna on Mobile +91 9948182222, Delhi@c1lindia.com or
Support@bankeauctions.com (Helpline No 7291981124,25,26). 5. For RARC 059 (RHDFCL HL) Trust
property Earnest Money Deposit (EMD) shall be deposited through RTGS/NEFT fund transfer to Current Account
No. 6742557088, Name of the Bank: Indian Bank Branch: Santacruz West Branch Mumbai, 400054, Name of the
Beneficiary: RARC 059 (RHDFCL HL) Trust, IFSC Code: IDIB000S010. Please note that the Cheques/Demand
Draft shall not be accepted towards EMD. 6. For RARC 080 (RHDFCL HL) Trust property Earnest Money Deposit
(EMD) shall be deposited through RTGS/NEFT fund transfer to Current Account No. 122505002146 Name of the
Bank: ICICI Bank Ltd. Branch: Veera Desai Branch Mumbai, 400058, Name of the Beneficiary: RARC 080
(RHDFCL HL) Trust, IFSC Code: ICIC0001225. Please note that the Cheques/Demand Draft shall not be
accepted towards EMD. 7. The Bids below reserve price and/or without EMD amount shall not be accepted.
Bidders may improve their further bid amount in multiple of Rs.5000 per lot. 8. The successful bidder shall deposit
25% of the bid amount/sale price (including EMD) immediately after declaration of successful bidder. The
successful bidder will deposit balance 75% of the bid amount/sale price within 15 days from the date of declaration
of successful bidder. 9. If successful bidder fails to deposit sale price as stated above, all deposits including EMD
will be forfeited. 10. The EMD amount of unsuccessful bidders will be returned without interest, after the closure of
the E-auction sale proceedings within Seven days. 11. The particulars given by the Authorized Officer are stated to
the best of his knowledge, belief and records. Authorized Officer shall not be responsible for any error,
misstatement or omission etc. 12. The undersigned Authorized Officer has the absolute right and discretion to
accept or reject any bid or adjourn/postpone/cancel the sale or modify any terms and conditions of the sale without
any prior notice or assigning any reasons. 13. The bidders should make discreet enquiries as regards to
charge/encumbrances/statutory dues on the property and should satisfy themselves about the title, extent, quality
of the property before submitting their bid. No claim of whatsoever nature regarding charges, encumbrances over
the property and any other matter etc., shall be entertained after submission of the online bid. 14. As per records
available, the undersigned have no information about any encumbrance on the properties as on the date of this
notice. 15. Any arrears, dues, taxes, VAT, TDS, GST, charges on the property whether statutory or otherwise
including stamp duty/registration fees on sale of property shall be borne by the purchaser only.

For any other information, please contact at 18001039711/18602664111 /18003099711 may be contacted.
STATUTORY 15 DAYS' NOTICE UNDER RULE 8(6) OF THE SECURITY INTEREST (ENFORCEMENT) RULES, 2002
The Borrower/Co-Borrowers/guarantors/mortgagers are hereby notified to pay the sum as mentioned above,
along with up to date interest and ancillary expenses before E- auction, failing which the e- auction of mortgaged
property mentioned above shall take place and balance dues if any shall be recovered with interest/cost. In Case of
no bid received in the auction sale on the date fixed for auction, the secured creditor shall be at liberty to sale this
property by way of private treaty on or above the reserve price fixed above to any prospective buyer. Borrower/Co-
Borrowers/Guarantors/Mortgagers are hereby called upon to SHIFT/REMOVE ALL HOUSEHOLD ARTICLES /
PERSONAL BELONGINGS IF ANY LYING IN THE REPOSSESSED PROPERTY, as per Panchnama/Inventory
report prepared at the time of taking possession of the mortgaged property, within 7 (seven) days from the date of
this notice. On failure to shift household articles/personal belongings within stipulated period of 7 (seven) days
from the date of this notice, the company shall be constrained to remove/shift/ dispose off the same on “as is where
is, as is what is and whatever there is basis” at Borrower/Co-Borrowers/guarantors/mortgagers risk, responsibilities
&cost. Company shall not be responsible for any claim raised by any party in this regard.

Place: TAMIL NADU Authorized Officer

Date: 04.12.2025 Reliance Asset Reconstruction Co. Ltd.

Note: Amount paid if any after issuance of Demand Notice under Section 13(2) of SARFAESI Act, 2002,
would be reckoned for ascertaining the dues payable at the time of realization/settlement.

Reliance Asset Reconstruction Company Ltd.
Corp. Office: 11th Floor, North Side, R-Tech Park, Western Express Highway,
Goregaon (East), Mumbai- 400063.

EEA (]

Asset Reconstruction

Notice for Sale of Secured Assets [See Rule 8(6)]

E-Auction Sale Notice for Sale of Inmovable Assets under the Securitisation and Reconstruction of Financial
Assets and Enforcement of Security Interest Act, 2002 read with proviso to Rule 8 (6) of the Security Interest
(Enforcement) Rules, 2002

Notice is hereby given to the public in general and in particular to the Borrower (s) and Guarantor (s) that the
below described immovable/movable properties mortgaged/hypothecated to the Secured Creditor, the
physical possession of which has been taken by the Authorised Officer of Secured Creditor.

That, Religare Housing Development Finance Corporation Ltd. has vide two separate Assignment Agreement
dated 29.03.2019 and 29.03.2023 assigned the financial assets/debts of below mentioned loan accounts
along with its right, title and interest together with underlying securities in favour of Reliance Asset
Reconstruction Company Ltd. (RARC) trustee of RARC 059 (RHDFCL HL) Trust and RARC 080
(RHDFCL HL) Trust. By virtue of the said assignment, we have become your secured creditor and lawfully
entitled to recover the entire contractual dues.

Therefore, the undersigned Authorised Officer of Reliance Asset Reconstruction Company Ltd., hereby give
you notice of 15 days that the below mentioned mortgaged properties shall be sold by the undersigned by way
of E-auction on “Asis whereis”, “Asis whatis”, and “Whatever there is” on 26.12.2025, for recovery of amount
mentioned in demand notice u/s 13(2) plus future interest and cost due to Reliance Asset Reconstruction
Company Limited as a trustee of RARC 059 (RHDFCL HL) Trust and RARC 080 (RHDFCL HL) Trust
Secured Creditor from mentioned borrowers/mortgagers. The reserve price and the earnest money deposit

(EMD)are as under: Description of mortgaged property:
hz‘ Borrowers name, Property Details, demand notice and possession date Res%ebl’rice

RARC 080 (RHDFCL HL) Trust

1 [ M KUMAR S/O MOGAN NO-736, PASIR RIS DRIVE 10, #09-049, SINGAPORE-510736,
ALSO AT: NO 2/18, SIVAN KOIL STREET, MELAPANYUR (THIRUMAYAM), PUDUKKOTTAI,
PUDUKKOTTA, TAMIL NADU-622412 AND JAYA M R/O NO-736, PASIR RIS DRIVE 10,#09-
049, SINGAPORE-510736, ALSO AT: NO 2/18, SIVAN KOIL STREET, MELAPANYUR
(THIRUMAYAM), PUDUKKOTTAI, PUDUKKOTTA, TAMIL NADU-622412 AND A
AMIRTHARAJ R/O NO 275 KLKS NAGAR, PUDUKKOTTAI, PUDUKKOTTA, TAMIL NADU-
622001 ALSO AT: NO 2/18, SIVAN KOIL STREET, MELAPANYUR (THIRUMAYAM),
PUDUKKOTTAI, PUDUKKOTTA, TAMIL NADU-622412
Property: ALL THAT PIECE AND PARCEL OF PUDUKOTTAI DISTRICT AND THIRUMAYAM
TAULAK AND THIURMAYAM SUB-REGISTRATION DISTRICT AND SITUATED AT
MELAPANAIYUR VILLAGE IN COMPROMISED WITH S.NO.737/8 AND HAVING AND
EXTENT OF 1090 SQUARE FEETWITHIN THIS MEASURING IN ALL 1090 SQUARE FEET
AND ALONG WITH USUAL EASEMENARY AND LAYOUT RIGHTS RELATING THERETO
BOUNDED ON THE:- AND BOUNDED BY:- EAST: PROPERTY BELONGS TO
VENGADASAMY, WEST. PROPERTY BELONGS TO VENGADASAMY, NORTH: PROPERTY
BELONGS TO GANESH@KANNAIYA, SOUTH: EASTTO WEST STREET
Demand notice: Rs. 15, 36,655.02/- (Rupees Fifteen Lakh Thirty Six Thousand Six Hundred
me Five and Two Paisa Only) ason 20-12-2022plus future interest & cost

hysical Pe date: 04.01.2025

Rs.
17,84,592/-

Rs.
1,78,459/-

Inspection of Property 1 23.12.2025 from11.00 A.M.t0 02.00 P.M.
Last date for bid submission : 24.12.2025ill 5.00 PM
Date of e-auction : 26.12.2025 between 11 AMto 1 P.Mwith extension of 5 minutes each

TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF SALE:

1. The property shall not be sold below the reserve price and sale is subject to the confirmation by RARC as a
secured creditor. 2. E-auction will be conducted ONLINE through M/s. C1 INDIAPVT LTD at Plot No 68 Gurgaon
Haryana pin Code 122003. 3. Before participating in E- auction, the intending bidders should hold a valid e-mail id
andregister their names at portal www.bankeauctions.com and get their User ID and password from M/s. C1 INDIA
PVTLTD.). 4. Prospective bidders may avail online training on E-Auction from M/s. C1 INDIAPVT LTD., (Contact
Person : Mr. Dharani Krishna on Mobile +91 9948182222, Delhi@c1india.com or
Support@bankeauctions.com (Helpline No 7291981124,25,26). 5. For RARC 059 (RHDFCL HL) Trust
property Earnest Money Deposit (EMD) shall be deposited through RTGS/NEFT fund transfer to Current Account
No. 6742557088, Name of the Bank: Indian Bank Branch: Santacruz West Branch Mumbai, 400054, Name of the
Beneficiary: RARC 059 (RHDFCL HL) Trust, IFSC Code: IDIB000S010. Please note that the Cheques/Demand
Draft shall not be accepted towards EMD. 6. For RARC 080 (RHDFCL HL) Trust property Earnest Money Deposit
(EMD) shall be deposited through RTGS/NEFT fund transfer to Current Account No. 122505002146 Name of the
Bank: ICICI Bank Ltd. Branch: Veera Desai Branch Mumbai, 400058, Name of the Beneficiary: RARC 080
(RHDFCL HL) Trust, IFSC Code: ICIC0001225. Please note that the Cheques/Demand Draft shall not be
accepted towards EMD. 7. The Bids below reserve price and/or without EMD amount shall not be accepted.
Bidders may improve their further bid amount in multiple of Rs.5000 per lot. 8. The successful bidder shall deposit
25% of the bid amount/sale price (including EMD) immediately after declaration of successful bidder. The

Ltd. (RARC) trustee of RARC 059 (RHDFCL HL) Trust and RARC 080
(RHDFCL HL) Trust By V|nue of the said assignment, we have become your secured creditor and lawfully
entitled to recover the entire contractual dues.

Therefore, the undersigned Authorised Officer of Reliance Asset Reconstruction Company Ltd., hereby give
you notice of 15 days that the below mentioned mortgaged properties shall be sold by the undersigned by way
of E-auction on “Asis where is”, “As is whatis”, and “Whatever there is” on 26.12.2025, for recovery of amount
mentioned in demand notice u/s 13(2) plus future interest and cost due to Reliance Asset Reconstruction
Company Limited as a trustee of RARC 059 (RHDFCL HL) Trust and RARC 080 (RHDFCL HL) Trust
Secured Creditor from mentioned borrowers/mortgagers. The reserve price and the earnest money deposit

(EMD)are as under: Description of mortgaged property:
hz‘ Borrowers name, Property Details, demand notice and p date ReseévMeDPrice

RARC 059 (RHDFCL HL) Trust

(i) RAMADOSS S, (ii) DEIVAYANAI R, (iii) RAGHU S, ALLR/O #19, MEERAHOMES, FLAT
NO. F2A, VWV GIRI STREET, RAM NAGAR, AMBATTUR, CHENNAI, TAMILNADU-600053,
ALSO AT:- PLOT NO.30, AMMAN NAGAR, ORAGADAM VILLAGE, AMABATTUR TALUK
AND THIRUVALLUR DISTRICT, TAMILNADU, ALSO AT:- #22/23, VIJALAKSHMI MAIN
ROAD, AMBATTUR, CHENNAI, TAMILNADU-600053

Property: ALL THAT PIECE AND PARCEL OF LAND AND PROPOSSED BUILDING,
BEARING PLOT NO.30, COMPRISED IN S.NO.65/4B, AS PER PATTANEW S.NO.65/4B2,
AS PER TSLR T.S.NO.20/2, MEASURING WITH AN EXTENT OF 2166 SQ. FT. SITUATED
AT "AMMAN NAGAR', ORAGADAM VILLAGE, AMABATTUR TALUK AND THIRUVALLUR
DISTRICT, TAMILNADU

Demand notice: Rs. 21,55,421.22/- (Rupees TwentyOne Lakh FiftyFive Thousand Four
Hundred TwentyOne Paise TwentyTwo Only) as on 15.02.2019 plus future interest & cost
Constructive/Physical Possession date: 07.02.2025

Rs.
27,05,319/-

Rs.
2,70,532/-

INDIAN TERRAIN FASHIONS LIMITED

Registered office and Address for communication: Survey No. 549/2 & 232, Plot No 4
& Industrial Area, Singap Koil Post, Ci - 603204, Tamil Nadu.
Email ID: response.itfl@indianterrain.com, Ph: 044 — 4227 9100 Website: www.indianterrain.com
CIN: L18101TN2009PLC073017

SPECIAL WINDOW FOR RE
OF TRANSFER REQUESTS OF PHYSICAI

GEMEN

HARES

SEBI through its Circular No. SEBI/HO/MIRSD-PoD/P/CIR/2025/97 dated 2" July 2025,
has decided to open a Special Window only for re-lodgement of transfer requests of
physical shares, for a period of Six Months from 7t" July 2025 till 6 January 2026 (“Re-
lodgement Window”). In this regard, we already had published Newspaper Ads on 1%
August 2025 and 6" October 2025.

This facility is available for Transfer Deeds lodged prior to 1°t April 2019 and which were
rejected / returned / not attended due to deficiency in the documents / process / or
otherwise. Please note that the shares for the said requests will be issued only is
dematerialized (demat) form upon successful processing of the requests during the
Re-lodgement Window period.

TATA CAPITAL HOUSING FINANCE LIMITED
Regd. Office: 11th Floor, Tower A, Peninsula Business Park Ganpatrao

Kadam Marg, Lower Parel, Mumbai — 400013. CIN
U67190MH2008PLC187552. Contact No. (022) 61827414, (022) 61827375

/{ POSSESSION NOTICE (FOR IMMOVABLE PROPERTY)

ANy (As per Rule 8(1) of the Security Interest Enforcement Rules, 2002)
Whereas, the undersigned being the Authorized Officer of the TATA Capital Housing Finance
Limited., under the Securitization and Reconstruction of Financial Assets and Enforcement of Security
Interest Act, 2002 and in exercise of powers conferred under section 13(12) read with rule 3 of the
Security Interest (Enforcement) Rules, 2002, issued a demand notice dated as below calling upon the
Borrowers to repay the amount mentioned in the notice within 60 days from the date of the said notice.
The borrower, having failed to repay the amount, notice is hereby given to the borrower, in particular
and the public, in general, that the undersigned has taken Possession of the property described here-
in below in exercise of powers conferred on him under section 13(4) of the said Act read with rule 8 of
the said Rules.
The borrower, in particular, and the public in general, are hereby cautioned not to deal with the proper-
ty and any dealings with the property will be subject to the charge of the TATA Capital Housing Finance
Limited, for an amount referred to below along with interest thereon and penal interest, charges, costs
etc. from date of demand notice.
The borrower’s attention is invited to provisions of sub-section (8) of Section 13 of the Act, in respect
of time available, to redeem the secured assets.

The Company and its Registrar and Transfer Agent (“RTA”) has a dedicated team to
facilitate processing of the transfer of shares during the aforesaid Re-lodgement

Window period.

Investors who have missed the earlier deadline of 315 March 2021 are encouraged to
take advantage of this opportunity by furnishing the necessary documents to the
Company and its RTA at the below given details:

Sl. Name of Obligor(s)/Legal Heir(s)/ | Amount & Date of | Date of
No. e BB, Legal Reggre(se)nta?ive s o Demand Notice [P i
1. [TCHHL0480000100 Rs. 69,49,503/-
136363 & MR. MANICKAMOORTHY.M, (Rupees Sixty Nine
TCHIN0480000100 as Borrower and Lakh Forty Nine ~ |03.12.2025
202412 & MRS. ANNALAKSHMI, Thousand Five Symbolic
TCHIN0480000100 as Co Borrowers Hundred and Three
136847 Only) & 09-09-2025

Coordinators
E-mail: secretarial@indianterrain.com
Tel No: 044 - 4227 9100
Regd. Address: Survey No. 549/2 & 232,
Plot No 4 Thirukkachiyur & Sengundram Industrial Area,
Singaperumal Koil Post, Chengalpattu — 603204, Tamil Nadu.

Particulars

Indian Terrain
Fashions Limited

Description of Secured Assets/Immovable Properties: i: Survey No: S.No.59/5A, 59/5B, 60/1,
60/2, 50/25, 59/6; ii. As Per Revenue Record: S.No.60/1; iii. Total Extent: 2176 sq.ft; iv. Door No.(
As per property tax): R.S.N0.60/2; iv. Location like name of the place, village, city, registra-
tion, sub-district, etc.: Deyvakanni street, Iravathanallur village, Madurai north taluk, Madurai
south SRO, Madurai south reg.District. vi. i)Boundaries for 2912 sq.ft of land with building North
by- siraiselvam house & chandhiriga land South by- Ramasamy vacant land East by- Ramasamy

You may raise service request through:
https://web.in.mpms.mufg.com/helpdesk/Service_Request.html
Tel No: +91-8108116767 (Toll-Free number: 1800 1020 878)

MUFG Intime India
Private Limited
(previously known as Link

vacant land West by- 23 ft pathway With all appurtenances, with easements rights and pathway.
2, | TCHHL048000 MRS. M SATHYA Rs. 17,46,029/- (Rupees
* 10100310229 & as Borrower and Seventeen Lakh Forty Six (03122025
TCHIN048000 | MR. MURUGAN MUNIYANDI| Thousand and Twenty Nine | Symbolic
0100311314 as Co Borrowers Only) & 09-09-2025

Intime India Private Limited) Address: C 101, Embassy 247, L.B,S.Marg, Vikhroli (West),

Mumbai — 400083, Maharashtra.
For INDIAN TERRAIN FASHIONS LIMITED
sd/-
Date: 4" December 2025 Sainath Sundaram
Place: Chennai Company y & C Officer

Description of Secured Assets/Immovable Properties: I. Survey No. S.No-170/18D1A;
II. Total Extent: 514 sq.Ft; lll. Door No (As per property tax): 19B; IV. Location like name
of the place, village, city, registration, sub- district etc. Madakulam Village, Madurai
South Taluk, Madurai South Regd.District, Madurai South Joint No-4 SRO. “Kaliyamman
Kovil Street”. V. i) Boundaries for 514 Sq.Ft of land with building North By - 20 Feet
Wide Road South By - Pottecheri Vaikkal East BY- Saraswathi Remaining Land West By
- Vellaiyan House and Lane. Measurement Details North - East West: 13 ft ; South - East
West: 13 ft, East - South North 40 ft, West - South North 39 ft. Total 514 sq.Ft. With all
easements Rights and Pathway

Place: MADURAI

Sd/- Authorised Officer

12.2025 For Tata Capital Housing Fi

Inspection of Property :23.12.2025 from11.00 A.M.t002.00 P.M.
Last date for bid submission : 24.12.2025ill 5.00 PM
Date of e-auction 1 26.12.2025 between 11 AMto 1 P.Mwith extension of 5 minutes each

TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF SALE:

1. The property shall not be sold below the reserve price and sale is subject to the confirmation by RARC as a
secured creditor. 2. E-auction will be conducted ONLINE through M/s. C1 INDIAPVT LTD at Plot No 68 Gurgaon
Haryana pin Code 122003. 3. Before participating in E- auction, the intending bidders should hold a valid e-mail id
and register their names at portal www.bankeauctions.com and get their User ID and password from M/s. C1 INDIA
PVTLTD.). 4. Prospective bidders may avail online training on E-Auction from M/s. C1 INDIA PVT LTD., (Contact
Person : Mr. Dharani Krishna on Mobile +91 9948182222, Delhi@c1india.com or
Support@bankeauctions.com (Helpline No 7291981124,25,26). 5. For RARC 059 (RHDFCL HL) Trust
property Earnest Money Deposit (EMD) shall be deposited through RTGS/NEFT fund transfer to Current Account
No. 6742557088, Name of the Bank: Indian Bank Branch: Santacruz West Branch Mumbai, 400054, Name of the
Beneficiary: RARC 059 (RHDFCL HL) Trust, IFSC Code: IDIB000S010. Please note that the Cheques/Demand
Draft shall not be accepted towards EMD. 6. For RARC 080 (RHDFCL HL) Trust property Earnest Money Deposit
(EMD) shall be deposited through RTGS/NEFT fund transfer to Current Account No. 122505002146 Name of the
Bank: ICICI Bank Ltd. Branch: Veera Desai Branch Mumbai, 400058, Name of the Beneficiary: RARC 080
(RHDFCL HL) Trust, IFSC Code: ICIC0001225. Please note that the Cheques/Demand Draft shall not be
accepted towards EMD. 7. The Bids below reserve price and/or without EMD amount shall not be accepted.
Bidders may improve their further bid amount in multiple of Rs.5000 per lot. 8. The successful bidder shall deposit
25% of the bid amount/sale price (including EMD) immediately after declaration of successful bidder. The
successful bidder will deposit balance 75% of the bid amount/sale price within 15 days from the date of declaration
of successful bidder. 9. If successful bidder fails to deposit sale price as stated above, all deposits including EMD
will be forfeited. 10. The EMD amount of unsuccessful bidders will be returned without interest, after the closure of
the E-auction sale proceedings within Seven days. 11. The particulars given by the Authorized Officer are stated to
the best of his knowledge, belief and records. Authorized Officer shall not be responsible for any error,
misstatement or omission etc. 12. The undersigned Authorized Officer has the absolute right and discretion to
acceptor reject any bid or adjourn/postpone/cancel the sale or modify any terms and conditions of the sale without
any prior notice or assigning any reasons. 13. The bidders should make discreet enquiries as regards to
charge/encumbrances/statutory dues on the property and should satisfy themselves about the title, extent, quality
of the property before submitting their bid. No claim of whatsoever nature regarding charges, encumbrances over
the property and any other matter etc., shall be entertained after submission of the online bid. 14. As per records
available, the undersigned have no information about any encumbrance on the properties as on the date of this
notice. 15. Any arrears, dues, taxes, VAT, TDS, GST, charges on the property whether statutory or otherwise
including stamp duty/registration fees on sale of property shall be borne by the purchaser only.

Forany otherinformation, please contact at 18001039711/18602664111 /18003099711 may be contacted.
STATUTORY 15 DAYS’ NOTICE UNDER RULE 8(6) OF THE SECURITY INTEREST (ENFORCEMENT) RULES, 2002
The Borrower/Co-Borrowers/guarantors/mortgagers are hereby notified to pay the sum as mentioned above,
along with up to date interest and ancillary expenses before E- auction, failing which the e- auction of mortgaged
property mentioned above shall take place and balance dues if any shall be recovered with interest/cost. In Case of
no bid received in the auction sale on the date fixed for auction, the secured creditor shall be at liberty to sale this
property by way of private treaty on or above the reserve price fixed above to any prospective buyer. Borrower/Co-
Borrowers/Guarantors/Mortgagers are hereby called upon to SHIFT/REMOVE ALL HOUSEHOLD ARTICLES /
PERSONAL BELONGINGS IF ANY LYING IN THE REPOSSESSED PROPERTY, as per Panchnama/Inventory
report prepared at the time of taking possession of the mortgaged property, within 7 (seven) days from the date of
this notice. On failure to shift household articles/personal belongings within stipulated period of 7 (seven) days
fromthe date of this notice, the company shall be constrained to remove/shift/ dispose off the same on “as is where
is, as is what is and whatever there is basis” at Borrower/Co-Borrowers/guarantors/mortgagers risk,
responsibilities & cost. Company shall not be responsible for any claim raised by any party in this regard.

Place: TAMIL NADU Authorized Officer

Date: 04.12.2025 Reliance Asset Reconstruction Co. Ltd.

Note: Amount paid if any after issuance of Demand Notice under Section 13(2) of SARFAESI Act, 2002,

would be reckoned for ascertaining the dues payable at the time of realization/settlement.

This is a Public Announcement for inform
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view the Prospectus)

and does not constitute an invitation or offer to acquire, purchase or subscribe to securities.

PUBLIC ANNOUNCEMENT

ation purposes only and is not a prospectus announcement

\V)Western Overseas

WESTERN OVERSEAS STUDY ABROAD LIMITED

(Formerly Known as Western Overs

(CIN- U80903HR2013PLC050433)

Our Company was originally incorporated at Haryana as “Western Overseas Study Abroad Private Limited” on 18th September, 2013 under the provisions of the Companies Act, 1956

vide Certificate of Incorporation issued by the Registrar of Companies, National Capital Territo

company, the name of our Company was changed to “Western Overseas Study Abroad Limited” vide fresh certificate of incorporation dated 24th September, 2024 issued by the Registrar
of Companies, Central Processing Centre. For further details please refer to chapter titled “History and Corporate Structure” beginning on page 158 of this Prospectus.

Registered Office: Ground Floor- First Floor, S.C.F No-27-28, Vi
Company Secretary and Compliance Officer: Ms. Shruti Gupta, Website: www.western-o

PROMOTERS OF OUR COMPANY: MR. PARDEEP BALYAN AND MS. REKHA RANI
“THE ISSUE IS BEING MADE IN ACCORDANCE WITH CHAPTER IX OF THE SEBI ICDR REGULATIONS (IPO OF SMALL AND MEDIUM ENTERPRISES) AND

THE EQUITY SHARES ARE PROPOSED TO BE LISTED ON SME PLATFORM OF

INITIAL PUBLIC OFFER OF 17,98,000 EQUITY SHARES OF FACE VALUE OF ¥10/- EACH (THE “EQUITY SHARES”) OF WESTERN OVERSEAS
STUDY ABROAD LIMITED (“OUR COMPANY” OR “THE ISSUER”) AT PRICE OF % 56/- PER EQUITY SHARE FOR CASH, AGGREGATING TO ¥
1,006.88 LAKHS (“THE ISSUE”) OF WHICH UPTO 90,000 EQUITY SHARES OF FACE VALUE OF RS. 10/- EACH FOR CASH AT A PRICE OF RS.

56.00/- PER EQUITY SHARE INCLUDING A SHARE PREMIUM OF RS. 46.0!

UP EQUITY SHARE CAPITAL OF OUR COMPANY.

RESERVED FOR SUBSCRIPTION BY MARKET MAKER TO THE ISSUE (THE “MARKET MAKER RESERVATION PORTION”). THE ISSUE LESS
THE MARKET MAKER RESERVATION PORTION LE. NET ISSUE OF 17,08,000 EQUITY SHARES OF FACE VALUE OF RS. 10/- EACH AT A PRICE
OF RS. 56.00/- PER EQUITY SHARE INCLUDING A SHARE PREMIUM OF RS. 46.00/- PER EQUITY SHARE AGGREGATING TO RS. 956.48 LAKHS
(THE “NET ISSUE”). THE ISSUE AND THE NET ISSUE WILL CONSTITUTE UPTO 29.91% AND 28.41% RESPECTIVELY OF THE POST ISSUE PAID

eas Study Abroad Private Limited)

ry of Delhi and Haryana. Consequent upon the conversion of our Company to public limited
kas Vihar, Ambala City, Ambala, Haryana, Pin Code: 134003.

verseas.com E-Mail: info@western-overseas.com Telephone No: + 91-171-3500064

BSE LIMITED (BSE SME).”

0/- PER EQUITY SHARE AGGREGATING TO RS. 50.40 LAKHS WILL BE

BIDS CAN BE MADE FOR A MINIMUM OF 4,000 EQUITY SHARES

FIXED PRICE ISSUE AT X 56/- PER EQUITY SHARE

AND IN MULTIPLES OF 2,000 EQUITY SHARES THEREAFTER.

ISSUE OPENS ON:

BID/ISSUE

PROGRAMME

THE EQUITY SHARES OF THE COMPANY WILL GET LISTED ON SME PLATFORM OF BSE. FO|

IN MAKING AN INVESTMENT DECISION, POTENTIAL INVESTORS MUST ONLY RELY ON THE INFORMATION INCLUDED IN THE PROSPECTUS AND THE TERMS OF THE ISSUE,
INCLUDING THE RISKS INVOLVED AND NOT RELY ON ANY OTHER EXTERNAL SOURCES OF INFORMATION ABOUT THE ISSUE AVAILABLE IN ANY MANNER.
The Issue Price is justified based on the qualitative factors, quantitative factors and KPIs disclosed in the chapter title “Basis for Issue Price” beginning on page 85 of the

Prospectus.

ISSUE CLOSES ON: MONDAY, DECEMBER 08, 2025

THURSDAY, DECEMBER 04, 2025

RTHE PURPOSE OF THE ISSUE, THE DESIGNATED STOCK EXCHANGE SHALL BE BSE.

HOME
A& RELIGARE |1ove.

% ot ing

RELIGARE HOUSING DEVELOPMENT FINANCE CORPORATION LTD. t

Regd. Office: First Floor, Office No. 101, 2E/23, Jhandewalan Extn., New Delhi-110055., India.

Corporate Office: 8th floor, Max House, Block A, Dr. Jha Marg, Okhla Phase 3, Okhla Industrial Estate,
New Delhi 110020, India. Phone : +91-11-4739 2500. CIN: U74899DL1993PLC054259;

E- AUCTION/SALE NOTICE

Notice is hereby given for conducting E-Auction sale under the Securitization and Reconstruction of Financial Assets
and Enforcement of Security Interest Act 2002 (SARFAESI ACT) and Rules 8(6) & 9(1) of the Security Interest
(Enforcement) Rules 2002 of the immovable properties, mortgaged to the M/s Religare Housing D

Finance Corporation Limited (hereinafter referred to as the “Secured Creditor/RHDFCL”. Whereas the below
mentioned borrower failed to repay the loan amounts to the Secured Creditor, within 60 days from the date of the
notice mentioned in table issued by its authorized officer under section 13(2) of the SARFAESIACT 2002.
WHEREAS the Secured Creditor has pursuant to the powers vested in it through its authorized officer taken the
POSSESSION of the mortgaged property as mentioned in table under the provisions of Rule 8(1) of the Security
Interest (Enforcement) Rules 2002 and under the provisions of section 13 (4) of the SARFAESIACT 2002 and in
exercise of the powers conferred there under.

WHEREAS even thereafter the borrower has failed to repay the aforesaid loan amount to the Secured Creditor,
the authorized officer of the Secured Creditor has decided to sell the scheduled property/ies “AS IS WHERE IS”,
“AS IS WHAT IS” and “WHATEVER THERE IS” basis through the process of INVITING BIDS CUMAUCTION
for the below mentioned property/ies from the intending buyers on the following terms and conditions:

Notice date and Reserved

Borrower(s) Name & Address Possession date Price EMD
1.J Antonysamy S/o Josepi And A Dellismari Notice Issued U/s 13(2) of
Both Rlo Door No.45, SF N0.2543, 2548, 2549, | SARFAESIACT 2002 on R R

o 22.12.2021 and the i >

2550, Ward No.1, Lakshmirajpuram Street, Conlsm;clwel ohysical 31,73,123/- | 3,17,312)-
Thanjavur Taluk, Tamilnadu-613003 POSSESSION taken
Secured Debt (Amount In Rs.): Rs.21,39,657.57 'hf°ggh0‘7“'z‘ggzze"d0fft'ﬁ9’
(Rupees Twenty One Lakh Thirty Nine Thousand °"pm;/isi'on p ggdign ©
Six Hundred Fifty Seven Paise Fifty Seven Only) As 14/Sec 13 (4) of the
0n22.12.2021 Plus Future Interest & Costs. SARFAESI ACT 2002

Description of Property:- All That Piece And Parcel Of Land & Building, Comprised In S.Nos. 2547,
2548, 2549 & 2550, Measuring With An Extent Of 1650 Sq.Ft, Situated At Ward No.1, Lakshmirajpuram
Street, Thanjavur Town, Thanjavur District And Bounded By:- East:- Property Belongs To Selvamani,
West:- Property Belongs To Selvamani North;- Kulamangalam Road South:-Venar River

f Property 23.12.2025 from 11.00A.M. to 02.00 P.M.

Last date for bid 24.12.2025till 5.00 PM

Date of E-auction 26.12.2025 between 11.00 AM to 1.00 P.M with extension of 5 minutes each

TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF SALE: 1) Full description of the above property is available with Authorized officer. The
properties/documents can be inspected after fixing date and time with the Authorized Officer. 2) E-auction will be
conducted ONLINE through M/s. C1 INDIA PVT LTD at Plot No 68 Gurgaon Haryana pin Code 122003. 3) Before
participating in E-auction, the intending bidders should hold a valid e-mail id and register their names at portal
www.bankeauctions.com and get their User ID and password from M/s. C1 INDIAPVT LTD. 4) Prospective bidders may
avail online training on E-Auction from M/s. C1 INDIA PVT LTD., (Contact Person : Mr.Dharani Krishna on Mobile +91
9948182222, Delhi@cindia.com or Support@bankeauctions.com (Helpline No 7291981124,25,26). 5) Eamest Money
Deposit (EMD) shall be deposited through electronic mode/RTGS/NEFT fund transfer to Current Account No.
57500001511642, Name of the Bank: HDFC Bank, Name of the Beneficiary: Religare Housing Development Finance
Corporation Limited, IFSC Code: HDFC0000003. Please note that the Cheque/Demand Draft shall not be accepted
towards EMD. 6) The Bids below reserve price and/or without EMD amount shall not be accepted. Bidders may improve
their further bid amountin multiple of Rs.5000 per lot. 7) The successful bidder is required to deposit 25% of the bid amount
(inclusive of EMD), on the same day by electronic mode / DD / Cheque drawn in favour of “M/s Religare Housing

successful bidder will deposit balance 75% of the bid amount/sale price within 15 days from the date of !
of successful bidder. 9. If successful bidder fails to deposit sale price as stated above, all deposits including EMD
will be forfeited. 10. The EMD amount of unsuccessful bidders will be returned without interest, after the closure of
the E-auction sale proceedings within Seven days. 11. The particulars given by the Authorized Officer are stated to
the best of his knowledge, belief and records. Authorized Officer shall not be responsible for any error,
misstatement or omission etc. 12. The undersigned Authorized Officer has the absolute right and discretion to
acceptor reject any bid or adjourn/postpone/cancel the sale or modify any terms and conditions of the sale without
any prior notice or assigning any reasons. 13. The bidders should make discreet enquiries as regards to
charge/encumbrances/statutory dues on the property and should satisfy themselves about the title, extent, quality
of the property before submitting their bid. No claim of whatsoever nature regarding charges, encumbrances over
the property and any other matter etc., shall be entertained after submission of the online bid. 14. As per records
available, the undersigned have no information about any encumbrance on the properties as on the date of this
notice. 15. Any arrears, dues, taxes, VAT, TDS, GST, charges on the property whether statutory or otherwise
including stamp duty/registration fees on sale of property shall be borne by the purchaser only.

Forany other information, please contact at 18001039711/18602664111 /18003099711 may be contacted.
STATUTORY 15 DAYS' NOTICE UNDER RULE 8(6) OF THE SECURITY INTEREST (ENFORCEMENT) RULES, 2002
The Borrower/Co-Borrowers/guarantors/mortgagers are hereby notified to pay the sum as mentioned above,
along with up to date interest and ancillary expenses before E- auction, failing which the e- auction of mortgaged
property mentioned above shall take place and balance dues if any shall be recovered with interest/cost. In Case of
no bid received in the auction sale on the date fixed for auction, the secured creditor shall be at liberty to sale this
property by way of private treaty on or above the reserve price fixed above to any prospective buyer. Borrower/Co-
Borrowers/Guarantors/Mortgagers are hereby called upon to SHIFT/REMOVE ALL HOUSEHOLD ARTICLES /
PERSONAL BELONGINGS IF ANY LYING IN THE REPOSSESSED PROPERTY, as per Panchnama/Inventory
report prepared at the time of taking possession of the mortgaged property, within 7 (seven) days from the date of
this notice. On failure to shift household articles/personal belongings within stipulated period of 7 (seven) days
from the date of this notice, the company shall be constrained to remove/shift/ dispose off the same on “as is where
is, as is what is and whatever there is basis” at Borrower/Co-Borrowers/guarantors/mortgagers risk,
responsibilities & cost. Company shall notbe responsible for any claim raised by any party in thisregard.

Place: TAMIL NADU Authorized Officer

Date: 04.12.2025 Reliance Asset Reconstruction Co. Ltd.

Note: Amount paid if any after issuance of Demand Notice under Section 13(2) of SARFAESI Act, 2002,
would be reckoned for ascertaining the dues payable at the time of realization/settlement.

Dy Finance Corp. Limited” payable at Delhi and the balance amount shall be paid by the successful
bidder within 15 days from the date of confirmation of sale by Secured Creditor. The EMD as well as Sale Price paid by the
interested bidders shall carry no interest. The deposit of EMD or 25% of sale price, whatever the case may be shall be
forfeited by the “RHDFCL", if the successful bidder fails to adhere to the terms of sale or commits any default. 8) The
successful bidder shall bear all expenses including statutory dues/taxes/bills etc. to Municipal Corporation or any other
authorities and fees payable for stamp duty, registration fee etc. for registration of the 'Sale Certificate’. 9) Secured
Creditor does not take any ibility to procure any ion/NOC from any Authority or under any other law in force
in respect of property offered or any other dues i.e. outstanding water/electric dues, property tax or other charges if any.
10) Any arrears, dues, taxes, VAT, TDS, GST, charges on the property whether statutory or otherwise including stamp
duty/registration fees on sale of property shall be borne by the purchaser only. 11) The bidders should make discreet
enquiries as regards to charge/encumbrances/statutory dues on the property and should satisfy themselves about the
title, extent, quality of the property before submitting their bid. No claim of whatsoever nature regarding charges,
encumbrances over the property and any other matter etc., shall be entertained after submission of the online bid. 12) The
Authorized Officer has absolute right to accept or reject any or all the offers/bids or adjourn/cancel the sale without
assigning any reason or modify any terms of sale without any prior notice. 13) To the best of its knowledge and information,
the “RHDFCL” is not aware of any encumbrances on the properties to be sold except of the “RHDFCL”. Interested
parties should make their own assessment of the properties to their satisfaction. Secured Creditor does not in any way
ormakes any rep with regard to the fitnesstitle of the aforesaid properties.
For any cther information, contact at : 18001039711 / 18602664111 / 18003099711 E-mail at :
igare.com may b d atthe above address

STAUTORY 15 DAYS NOTICE UNDER RULE 8(6) & 9(1) OF THE SECURITY INTEREST (ENFORCEMENT) RULES 2002
The 0-Bo are hereby notified to pay the sum as mentioned above along, with
up to date interest and ancillary expenses before auction, failing which the auction of mortgaged property mentioned
above shall take place and balance dues if any shall be recovered with interest/cost. In Case of no bid received in the
auction sale on the date fixed for auction, the secured creditor shall be at liberty to sale this property by way of private treaty
on or above the reserve price fixed above to any prospective buyer. Borrower/Co-Borrowers/Guarantors/Mortgagers are
hereby called upon to SHIFT/REMOVE ALL HOUSEHOLD ARTICLES / PERSONAL BELONGINGS IF ANY LYING IN

*Application Supported by Blocked
simply blocking the fund in the bank
apply through the ASBA process. Fo

Simple, Safe, Smart
way of Application!!!

ASBA

Amount (ASBA) is a better way of applying to issues by
account. No cheque will be accepted. Investors have to
rfurther details read section on ASBA below.

Mandatory In Public Issues
From January 01, 2016. No
Cheque Will Be Accepted.

UPI-Now available in ASBA for Individual Investor who appl
minimum application size for amount upto ¥5,00,000/-. UPI-N

Li—»

LINIFTED PAVMENTS INTERFACE

September 17, 2021 and CBDT circular no. 7 of 2022, dated
pressreleases in this regard
Investors have to apply through the ASBA process. ASBA has

Prospectus. The process is also available on the website of
General Information Document.
ASBA forms can be downloaded from the website of BSE Limited

Sponsor Bank for the Issue, in accordance with the requirements

upto T5,00,000/-, applying through Registered Brokers, DPs and RTAs. UPI Bidder also has the option to submit the application directly to the ASBA
Bank (SCSBs) or to use the facility of linked online trading, demat and bank account. Investors are required to ensure that the bank account used for
bidding is linked to their PAN. Bidders must ensure that their PAN is linked with Aadhaar and are in compliance with CBDT notification dated February
13, 2020, issued by the Central Board of Direct Taxes and the subsequent press releases, including press releases dated June 25, 2021 and

please refer to the details given in ASBA form, Abridged Prospectus and also refer to the section “Issue Procedure” beginning on page no 244 of the

at www.sebi.gov.in. List of banks supporting UPI is also available on the website of SEBI at www.sebi.gov.in. ICICI Bank Limited has been appointed as

ies for minimum application size and to other investors who applies for more than
ow available in ASBA for Individual Investors and other investors applying for amount

March 30, 2022 read with press release dated March 28, 2023 and any subsequent
0 be availed by all the Investors. For details on the ASBA process and the UPI process,
Association of Investment Bankers of India (‘AIBI’), the Stock Exchange and in the

(“BSE”) and can be obtained from the list of banks thatis displayed on the website of SEBI

of the SEBI circular dated November 01,2018, as amended.

ATTENTION |
NOTICE TO INVESTORS (“NOTICE”) - CORRIGENDUM

(“CORRIGENDUM?”)

This Corrigendum is with reference to the Prospectus dated 25" November, 2025 filed with Registrar of Companies (“ROC”).

The attention of the investors is drawn to the following:

1. Onpage 241 of the Prospectus, particulars for Minimum Application Size in table for Issue structure in respect of the Issue shall stand replaced with the following:

NVESTORS
TO THE PROSPECTUS DATED NOVEMBER 25, 2025

Minimum Application
Size
For Individuals Investors who applies for minimum application siz

For Other than Individual Investors who applies for minimum application size:
Such number of Equity Shares in multiples of 2000 Equity Shares of face value of 10/- each more than two lots and the Bid amount exceeds %2.00 lakhs.

Two lots such that the application size shall be above X2.00 lakhs in multiples of 2000 Equity Shares.

e:

2. 0npage 75and 78 of the Prospectus, the word “Expenditure to be met from Net Proceeds”

The information above modifies and updates the information as applicable in the prospectus, the Prospectus accordingly stands amended to the extent stated hereinabove and the
above changes are to be read in conjunction with the Prospectus. Unless specified otherwise, all capitalised terms used herein shall have the same meaning ascribed to such terms in

Prospectus.

All capitalized terms used herein and not specifically defined shall have the same meaning as prescribed to them in the Prospectus.

Date - 03/12/2025
Place — Ambala, Haryana

LEAD MANAGER TO THE ISSUE

= SOBHAGYA

s CAPITAL OPTIONS PVT, LTD.

Skyl

TRAR TO THE ISSUE

shall stand replaced and be read as “Expenditure to be met from Internal Accruals”.

For Western Overseas Study Abroad Limited
On behalf of the Board of Directors

Sd/-

Pardeep Balyan

Managing Director

DIN: 06594346

| COMPANY SECRETARY AND COMPLIANCE OFFICER

@ Western Overseas

m-_a’..r';mwl

PRIVATE LIMITED
(Formerly Known as Sobhagya Capital Options Limited)
Registered office: E-227, Basement, East of Kailash,
Delhi, Capital Territory of Delhi India - 110065

Corporate office: C-7&7A, Hosiery Complex,

Phase-Il Extension, Noida-201305, Uttar Pradesh

Tel No. +91-7836066001

Email 1d: cs@sobhagyacap.com

Investor Grievance Email: delhi@sobhagyacap.com
Website: www.sobhagyacap.com

SEBI Registration Number: INM000008571

Contact Person: Mr. Rishabh Singhvi

Phase-I, New Delhi — 110020
Tel. No.: 011-40450193-197
Fax No: 011-26812683
Email: ipo@skylinerta.com

Website: www.skylinerta.com

A SEBI Banking pany Financial Serwces Pvt er'
SOBHAGYA CAPITAL OPTIONS SKYLINE FINANCIAL SERVICES MS. SHRUTI GUPTA
PRIVATE LIMITED WESTERN OVERSEAS STUDY ABROAD LIMITED

D-153A, First Floor, Okhla Industrial Area,

Investor Grievance Email: grievances@skylinerta.com

SEBI Registration No.: INR000003241
Contact Person: Mr. Anuj Rana

Ground Floor- First Floor, S.C.F No-27-28, Vikas Vihar,
Ambala City, Ambala, Haryana, Pin Code: 134003
Tel No: + 91- 171-3500064

Email: info@western-overseas.com
Website: www.western-overseas.com

Investors can contact the Company Secretary and Compliance
Officer or the Registrar to the Issue in case of any pre-issue or
post- issue related grievances, grievances including non-
receipt of letters of allotment, non-credit of allotted equity
shares in the respective beneficiary account, non-receipt of
refund orders or non-receipt of funds by electronic mode, etc.
For all Issue related queries and for redressal of complaints,
investors may also write to the LM.

THE REPOSSESSED PROPERTY, as per Panchnamallnventory report prepared at the time of taking possession of the
mortgaged property, within 7 (seven) days from the date of this notice. On failure to shift household articles/personal
belongings within stipulated period of 7 (seven) days from the date of this notice, the company shall be constrained to
remove/shift / dispose off the same on “as is where is, as is what is and whatever there is basis” at Borrower/Co-
Borrowers/guarantors/mortgagers risk, responsibilities & cost. Company shall not be responsible for any claim raised by
any partyin this regard.

Place : Tamil Nadu

Authorised Officer

M/s Religare Housing Development Finance Corporation Limited

Note: Amount paid
would be reckoned for ascert:

Western Overseas Study Abroad is proposing, subject to market conditions and other consid

Companies, Delhi on November 27, 2025. The Prospectus is available on the website of the Lead Manager at www.sobhagyacapital.com the website of the BSE i.e.,

and website of our Company at www.western-overseas.com
Investor should note that investment in equity shares involves a high degree of risk. For deta

Factors” on page 27 of the Prospectus, which has been filed with ROC. The Equity Shares have not been and will not be registered under the U.S. Securities Act (“the Securities Act”) or
any state securities laws in United States and may not be issued or sold within the United States or to, or for the account or benefit of, “U.S, persons” (as defined in Regulations under the

securities Act), except pursuant to an exemption from, orin atransaction not subjectto, the reg

erations, public Issue of its Equity Shares and has filed the Prospectus with the Registrar of
www.bseindia.com

ils, investors should refer to and rely on the Prospectus, including the section titled “Risk

istration requirements of the Securities Act of 1933.
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