
 

 

Through Online Filing                                                                                          06th August, 2025 
Ref No: AIL/CS/2025-26/24 
 
To, 
The Manager - Listing Department,  
National Stock Exchange of India Limited 
Exchange Plaza, C-1, Block –G, Bandra Kurla Complex,  
Bandra (East), Mumbai- 400051. 

Symbol: ACTIVEINFR                                                                                     ISIN: INE0KLO01025 
 
 
Sub: Intimation under Regulation 30 of the Securities and Exchange Board of India (Listing 
Obligations and Disclosure Requirements) Regulations, 2015: 
 
Receipt of Purchase Order from Mecgale Pneumatics Pvt. Ltd., for a Consideration of Rs. 
5,30,00,000/-only plus applicable Taxes. 
 
Dear Sir, 

It is to inform you that, the Company M/s ACTIVE INFRASTRUCTURES LIMITED (formerly 
known as Active Infrastructures Private Limited), has received and accepted the Purchase Order from 
Mecgale Pneumatics Pvt. Ltd., having its registered office at N-65, M.I.D.C. Industrial Area Hingna, 
Nagpur, Maharashtra, India, 440016, on 06th August, 2025 for Supply of Material for “Up-gradation of 
visitor amenities/ facilities, enhancement of built and natural features at Chaturdash Devta Temple and 
Kasba Kalibari Temple and Reconstruction of Yatri Niwas at Chaturdash Devta Temple Agartala Site”, 
as mentioned in the Purchase Order on the agreed Consideration of Rs. 5,30,00,000/- (Rupees Five 
Crore Thirty Lakhs Only), plus applicable Taxes, for the aforementioned scope of Services. 

It is requested to take the aforesaid submission in your records and acknowledge the receipt. 

Further details are mentioned in Annexure-1 
 
For ACTIVE INFRASTRUCTURES LIMITED 
 
 
 
 

NITESH SANKLECHA 
MANAGING DIRECTOR 
(DIN: 03532145) 

 
 



 

 

Annexure-1 
Declaration 

Sr. No.  Particulars Details of Project 

a. Name of the entity awarding the 
order(s) or contract(s) 

M/s. Mecgale Pneumatics Pvt. Ltd. having its 
registered office at N-65, M.I.D.C. Industrial Area 
Hingna, Nagpur, Maharashtra, India.  

b. Significant terms and conditions of 
order(s) and contract(s) 

Key terms includes clauses like, Packing & 
forwarding Charges, Transportation, Dispatch 
Clearance/ Dispatch Particular, Payment Terms, 
Delivery Period, etc. The order is expected to 
contribute positively to the Company’s revenue. 

c. Whether order[s] / contract(s) have 
Domestic Entity been awarded by 
domestic/ international entity; 

Domestic 

d. Nature of order(s] / contract(s); Up-gradation of visitor amenities/ facilities, 
enhancement of built and natural features at 
Chaturdash Devta Temple and Kasba Kalibari 
Temple and Reconstruction of Yatri Niwas at 
Chaturdash Devta Temple Agartala Site. 

e. Whether domestic or international; Domestic 

f. Time period by which the order(s) 
/contract(s) is to be executed 

12 Months  

g. Broad consideration or size of order(s) 
contract (s) 

Contract price for the said purchase order will be 
INR 5,30,00,000/- (Rupees Five Crore Thirty Lakhs 
Only), plus applicable Taxes. 

h. Whether the promoter/ promoter 
group/group companies have any 
interest in the entity that awarded the 
order(s)/contract(s)? If yes, nature of 
interest and details thereof; 

NA/ No 

i. Whether the order(s)/contract(s) 
would fall within related party 
transactions? If yes, whether the same 
is done at “arms length”. 

NA/ No 

 









---------- Forwarded message ---------
From: Nitesh Sanklecha <nitesh.sanklecha@raisoni.net>
Date: Wed, Aug 6, 2025 at 5:48 PM
Subject: Re: I3066 - PO- 154- Purchase order for Supply of Material - TTDCL- _Upgradation Work of Chaturdasha Devta
Temple & Kasbakalibari (CDT-KKT) Agartala
To: <amey.tuptewar@mecgale.com>
Cc: Prashant Waghmare <prashant.waghmare@mecgale.com>, Rohit Hedau <rohit.h@mecgale.com>, Sharad Srivastav
<sharad.srivastav@mecgale.com>

Hi Amey,

We hereby acknowledge the same and we confirm also

Thanx

On Wed, Aug 6, 2025 at 5:15 PM Amey Tuptewar <amey.tuptewar@mecgale.com> wrote:
Dear Sir
 
Kindly ignore earlier trailing mail
 
Subject : Purchase order for Supply of Materials.
 
Respected Sir,
 
Please find attached the Purchase order (MPPL-I3066/2025-26/PO-154/CDT-KK/TTDCL) for Supply of Materials.
 
Kindly acknowledge receipt and share a signed copy of the PO for our records.
 
Thanks & Regards,
Amey Tuptewar
अमेय तुप्तेवार
Mecgale Pneumatics Pvt. Ltd. |N-65, MIDC, Hingna | Nagpur- 440016| 
Mobile No: +91- 8830443602
 

From: Amey Tuptewar [mailto:amey.tuptewar@mecgale.com]
Sent: Wednesday, August 06, 2025 4:02 PM
To: 'nitesh.sanklecha@raisoni.net'
Cc: 'Prashant Waghmare'; 'rohit.h@mecgale.com'; 'Sharad Srivastav'
Subject: I3066 - PO- 154- Purchase order for Supply of Material - TTDCL- _Upgradation Work of Chaturdasha Devta
Temple & Kasbakalibari (CDT-KKT) Agartala
 
Good Afternoon !!
 
Subject : Purchase order for Supply of Materials.
 
Respected Sir,
 
Please find attached the Purchase order (MPPL-I3066/2025-26/PO-154/CDT-KK/TTDCL) for Supply of Materials.
 
Kindly acknowledge receipt and share a signed copy of the PO for our records.
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Thanks & Regards,
Amey Tuptewar
अमेय तुप्तेवार
Mecgale Pneumatics Pvt. Ltd. |N-65, MIDC, Hingna | Nagpur- 440016| 
Mobile No: +91- 8830443602
 

--
CA. Dr. Nitesh Sanklecha
345, Kingsway, Shradha House,
Nagpur-01
M : 9604020000
Tel: 0712-6611000

--
CA. Dr. Nitesh Sanklecha
345, Kingsway, Shradha House,
Nagpur-01
M : 9604020000
Tel: 0712-6611000

Disclaimer - This email and any files transmitted with it are confidential and intended solely for the
use of the individual or entity to whom they are addressed. This message contains confidential
information and is intended only for the individual named. If you are not the named addressee you
should not disseminate, distribute or copy this e-mail. Please notify the sender immediately by e-mail
if you have received this e-mail by mistake and delete this e-mail from your system. If you are not the
intended recipient you are notified that disclosing, copying, distributing or taking any action in reliance
on the contents of this information is strictly prohibited.
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